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A B C D E F G H I J K
Custodial Supply Bid Awards 
Vendor W.B Mason Zep Interboro Erzen Cintas * AGF Central Poly Fagan UniFirst UniPack

has alternates has alternates
Item Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1.  Hand Soap*

2.  Toilet Paper 15.36

3.  Paper Towels 16.68

4.  Sanitizer 145

5.  Disinfectant 27.47

6.  Disinfectant 124.5

7.  Floor Finish 57.75

8.  Stripper 44.11

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal Alt #9B 10.68

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal Alt #10D 14.82

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 Alt #11C 20.32

12.  Gloves Medium 95
Gloves Large 95
Gloves Extra-Large 95

*There were no bids that met specifications for #1 Hand Soap



Custodial Supply Bid Tab 5/17/2021 10 a.m.
Vendor
Sage Pope W.B. Mason
Item Price Quantity Alt Price Quantity
1.  Hand Soap No Bid

2.  Toilet Paper 41.48

3.  Paper Towels 56.58

4.  Sanitizer No Bid

5.  Disinfectant No Bid

6.  Disinfectant No Bid

7.  Floor Finish 57.75

8.  Stripper 52.25

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal 12.99

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal 12.55

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 No Bid

12.  Gloves Medium 95
Gloves Large
Gloves Extra-Large



Notes

Kimberly Clark 2 Ply 

Kimberly Clark

W.B. Mason Brand



Custodial Supply Bid Tab 5/17/2021 10 a.m.
Vendor
Zep
Item Price Quantity Alt Price Quantity
1.  Hand Soap 44

2.  Toilet Paper no bid

3.  Paper Towels no bid

4.  Sanitizer 40

5.  Disinfectant 45

6.  Disinfectant 47

7.  Floor Finish 64

8.  Stripper 52

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal no bid

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal no bid

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 no bid

12.  Gloves Medium no bid
Gloves Large
Gloves Extra-Large



Notes
Requires Fushion select despenser

per case. 

per case. 

per case

Confirm Price

per pale



Custodial Supply Bid Tab 5/17/2021 10 a.m.
Vendor
Interboro Packaging Corp
Item Price Quantity Alt Price Quantity
1.  Hand Soap no bid

2.  Toilet Paper no bid

3.  Paper Towels no bid

4.  Sanitizer no bid

5.  Disinfectant no bid

6.  Disinfectant no bid

7.  Floor Finish no bid

8.  Stripper no bid

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal 12.94

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal 25.68 19.48

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 25.84 23.98

12.  Gloves Medium 112
Gloves Large
Gloves Extra-Large



Notes

16.34, 14.82, 11.82 additional alternates

20.32, 16.34, 13.72 additional alternates



Custodial Supply Bid Tab 5/17/2021 10 a.m.
Vendor
Erzen Associates
Item Price Quantity Alt Price Quantity
1.  Hand Soap no bid

2.  Toilet Paper no bid

3.  Paper Towels no bid

4.  Sanitizer 145

5.  Disinfectant 27.47

6.  Disinfectant 135

7.  Floor Finish 80.11

8.  Stripper 87.94

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal 16.14

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal 25.45

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 no bid

12.  Gloves Medium no bid
Gloves Large
Gloves Extra-Large



Notes



Custodial Supply Bid Tab 5/17/2021 10 a.m.
Vendor
Cintas
Item Price Quantity Alt Price Quantity
1.  Hand Soap 62.5

2.  Toilet Paper 15.36

3.  Paper Towels 16.68

4.  Sanitizer .5 per unit

5.  Disinfectant 1.75 per unit

6.  Disinfectant 1.75 per unit

7.  Floor Finish no bid

8.  Stripper no bid

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal 18.99

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal 39.99

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 53.99

12.  Gloves Medium 95
Gloves Large
Gloves Extra-Large



Notes
per case cintas brand

per case

.5 per cintas unit



Custodial Supply Bid Tab 5/17/2021 10 a.m.
Vendor
AGF Company
Item Price Quantity Alt Price Quantity
1.  Hand Soap no bid

2.  Toilet Paper no bid

3.  Paper Towels no bid

4.  Sanitizer no bid

5.  Disinfectant no bid

6.  Disinfectant no bid

7.  Floor Finish 85.1

8.  Stripper 69.5

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal 18.69

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal 29.34

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 50.03

12.  Gloves Medium no bid
Gloves Large
Gloves Extra-Large



Notes



Custodial Supply Bid Tab 5/17/2021 10 a.m.
Vendor
Central Poly Bag Corp.
Item Price Quantity Alt Price Quantity
1.  Hand Soap no bid

2.  Toilet Paper no bid

3.  Paper Towels no bid

4.  Sanitizer no bid

5.  Disinfectant no bid

6.  Disinfectant no bid

7.  Floor Finish no bid

8.  Stripper no bid

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal 11.4

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal 15.8

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 21.1

12.  Gloves Medium no bid
Gloves Large
Gloves Extra-Large



Notes



Custodial Supply Bid Tab 5/17/2021 10 a.m.
Vendor
Fagan
Item Price Quantity Alt Price Quantity
1.  Hand Soap no bid

2.  Toilet Paper 32.6

3.  Paper Towels 41.71

4.  Sanitizer no bid

5.  Disinfectant no bid

6.  Disinfectant 124.5

7.  Floor Finish 69.4

8.  Stripper 44.11

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal no bid

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal no bid

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 no bid

12.  Gloves Medium no bid
Gloves Large
Gloves Extra-Large



Notes



Custodial Supply Bid Tab 5/17/2021 10 a.m.
Vendor
UniFirst
Item Price Quantity Alt Price Quantity
1.  Hand Soap 15

2.  Toilet Paper 33

3.  Paper Towels 39

4.  Sanitizer no bid

5.  Disinfectant no bid

6.  Disinfectant no bid

7.  Floor Finish no bid

8.  Stripper no bid

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal 22.6

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal 75.72

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 74

12.  Gloves Medium 61
Gloves Large
Gloves Extra-Large



Notes
dispesner free of charge

10 per box per case



Custodial Supply Bid Tab 5/17/2021 10 a.m.
Vendor
Unipack
Item Price Quantity Alt Price Quantity
1.  Hand Soap no bid

2.  Toilet Paper no bid

3.  Paper Towels no bid

4.  Sanitizer no bid

5.  Disinfectant no bid

6.  Disinfectant no bid

7.  Floor Finish no bid

8.  Stripper no bid

9. Trash Can Liner 33gal 13.6 16.58

10.  Trash Can Liner 56gal 19.5 24.9

11.  Trash Can Liner 50x59 43

12.  Gloves Medium 147
Gloves Large
Gloves Extra-Large



Notes

xhd , sxhd

xhd , sxhd
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